BID TABULATIONS
PROJECT:HAPPY HOLLOW PARK RESTROOM AND SHELTER REPLACEMENT PROJECT
DATE: 7/12/2017

ESTIMATED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY
1. Mobilization 1
2. Erosion Control, Installation and Removal 1
3. Demolition/Removals 1
4. Earthwork/Grading 680
5. 4" PCC Paving 143
6. 6" HMA Patch 6
7. Remove/Replace Grill 1
8. Final Grade/ Hyrdoseed 0.3
9. Sanitary Service 35.0
10. Water Service 50.0
11. New Restroom Facility 1.0
12. New Shelter Facility 1.0
BASE BID TOTAL
ALTERNATES
1a Splitface CMU Facia, Shelter 8
1b Natural Stone Fascia, Shelter 8
2 Alternate Water Service Installation 1

BASE BID ONLY

BASE BID + ALTERNATE #1a TOTAL
BASE BID + ALTERNATE #1bTOTAL
BASE BID + ALTERNATE #2 TOTAL

BID TAB-HAPPY HOLLOW.xis
7113/2017

UNITS

EA
EA
LS

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE Tricon General Construction Inc. Calacci Construction Company, Inc. SWA Woodruff Construction LLC North Contruction, LLC
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED

PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
$11,000.00 11,500.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 14,053.00 14,053.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 28,209.00 28,209.00 18,250.00 18,250.00
$1,000.00 1,000.00 1,700.00 1,700.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 1,900.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 2,600.00 2,600.00
$10,000.00 10,000.00 9,000.00 9,000.00 16,968.00 16,968.00 9,105.00 9,105.00 8,278.00 8,278.00 17,600.00 17,600.00
$5.50 3,740.00 14.00 9,520.00 14.00 9,520.00 10.50 7,140.00 10.00 6,800.00 6,300.00
$35.00 5,005.00 54.00 7,722.00 54.00 7,722.00 52.00 7,436.00 32.00 4,576.00 6,900.00
$100.00 600.00 100.00 600.00 100.00 600.00 220.00 1,320.00 300.00 1,800.00 2,200.00
$500.00 500.00 1,250.00 1,250.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 150.00 150.00 700.00 700.00 975.00 975.00
$3.500.00 1,050.00 5,000.00 1,500.00 10,000.00 3,000.00 11,000.00 3,300.00 9,500.00 2,850.00 4,300.00
$70.00 2,450.00 60.00 2,100.00 45.00 1,675.00 31.00 1,085.00 35.00 1,225.00 2,750.00
$60.00 3,000.00 50.00 2,500.00 55.00 2,750.00 31.00 1,550.00 28.00 1,400.00 2,750.00
$70,430.00 70,430.00 215,108.00 215,108.00 104,392.00 104,392.00 182,619.00 182,619.00 99,158.00 99,158.00 96,426.00 96,426.00
$66,725.00 66,725.00 100,000.00 100,000.00 90,900.00 90,900.00 121,750.00 121,750.00 95,656.00 95,656.00 104,444.00 104,444.00
176,000.00 361,000.00 253,480.00 342,355.00 251,652.00 265,495.00
$200.00 1,600.00 250.00 2,000.00 950.00 7,600.00 690.00 5,520.00 No Bid No Bid 4,700.00
$750.00 6,000.00 500.00 4,000.00 1,200.00 9,600.00 1,380.00 11,040.00 No Bid No Bid 7,600.00
16,000.00 16,000.00 5,500.00 5,500.00 4,500.00 4,500.00 7,260.00 7,260.00 6,600.00 6,600.00 7,500.00
176,000.00 361,000.00 253,480.00 342,355.00 251,652.00 265,495.00
200.00 177,600.00 250.00 363,000.00 950.00 261,080.00 690.00 347,875.00 No Bid 0 No Bid 4,700.00 270,195.00
750.00 182,000.00 500.00 365,000.00 1,200.00 263,080.00 1,380.00 353,395.00 No Bid 0 No Bid 7,600.00 273,095.00
16,000.00 192,000.00 5,500.00 366,500.00 4,500.00 257,980.00 7,260.00 349,615.00 6,600.00 258,252.00 7.500.00 272,995.00



